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ANNEX A 
 

REQUEST UNDER THE FREEDOM OF INFORMATION (SCOTLAND) ACT 2002 (FOISA) 
 
REASONS FOR NOT PROVIDING INFORMATION  
 
Section 17 (a) of FOISA (information not held)  
 
For the requests as numbered in our response.  
 
1. An exemption under section 17 (a) of FOISA applies to the information requested. Scottish 

Forestry is not required to provide information which it does not have. Scottish Forestry does 
not have the information you have requested because for previous years we did not record 
overtime separately, so we do not hold this information. 

 
This exception is subject to the 'public interest test'. Despite not holding this information, we 
have a statutory obligation to apply this test. Therefore, taking account of all the 
circumstances of this case, we have considered if the public interest in disclosing the 
information outweighs the public interest in applying the exemption. We have found that, on 
balance, the public interest lies in favour of upholding the exemption. While we recognise 
that there may be some public interest in the total amount of money spent by Scottish 
Forestry on overtime payments, we did not record overtime separately information in a 
readily available format to provide and would require complex skill and judgement to 
prepare, so we do not hold this and cannot provide information that we do not hold. 

 
2. An exemption under section 17 (a) of FOISA applies to the information requested. Scottish 

Forestry is not required to provide information which it does not have. This is because we do 
not have records detailing money spent on fixing or replacing broken equipment, so do not 
hold this information. 

 
This exception is subject to the 'public interest test'. Despite not holding this information, we 
have a statutory obligation to apply this test. Therefore, taking account of all the 
circumstances of this case, we have considered if the public interest in disclosing the 
information outweighs the public interest in applying the exemption. We have found that, on 
balance, the public interest lies in favour of upholding the exemption. While we recognise 
that there may be some public interest in the total amount of money spent by Scottish 
Forestry money spent on fixing or replacing broken equipment, we did not record this 
information and cannot provide information on this that we do not hold. 
 

8. An exemption under section 17 (a) of FOISA applies to the information requested. Scottish 
Forestry is not required to provide information which it does not have. This is because 
Scottish Forestry has a Service Level Agreement with FLS, which includes the provision for 
services on spend on equality, diversity, and inclusion within an overall charge for Human 
Resources and is not broken down to this level.  
 
This exception is subject to the 'public interest test'. Despite not holding this information, we 
have a statutory obligation to apply this test. Therefore, taking account of all the 
circumstances of this case, we have considered if the public interest in disclosing the 
information outweighs the public interest in applying the exemption. We have found that, on 
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balance, the public interest lies in favour of upholding the exemption. While we recognise 
that there may be some public interest in the total amount of money spent by Scottish 
Forestry on the provision for services on equality, diversity, and inclusion, as this included 
within an overall charge for Human Resources and would require complex skill and 
judgement to prepare, so we do not hold this and cannot provide information that we do not 
hold.  

 
 
 
 
 
 




