

REASONS FOR NOT PROVIDING INFORMATION

The Scottish Government does not have the information.

Section 17(1) of FOISA (information not held) requires the Scottish Government to notify you if it does not have the information you requested.

Question 4: In respect of Q3, can you please confirm the estimated monthly spend on each of the sizes i.e. 100ml, 236ml, 500ml and 5L.

Two Conservancies (Perth & Argyll and Highland & Islands) do not hold this information.

Question 8: In respect of Question 7, can you please confirm the estimated monthly spend on each of the sizes i.e. small, medium, large, extra-large.

Two Conservancies (Perth & Argyll and Highland & Islands) do not hold this information.

Question 9: Please provide the name of the company(s) currently supplying Nitrile Gloves.

Two Conservancies (Perth & Argyll and Highland & Islands) do not hold this information.

Question 10: Can you confirm if Type IIR Face Masks is being procured to combat Covid-19.

One Conservancy (Perth & Argyll) does not hold this information.

Question 16: In respect of Q15 can you please confirm the estimated usage on a monthly basis for each of the sizes i.e. Tubs of 100 and Tubs of 500 Alcohol Antibacterial Wipes.

One Conservancy (Perth & Argyll) does not hold this information.

Question 17: In respect of Question 16, can you please confirm the estimated monthly spend on Tubs of 100 and Tubs of 500 Alcohol Antibacterial Wipes.

Two Conservancies (Perth & Argyll and Highland & Islands) do not hold this information.