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From:

Sent: 23 October 2018 12:36

To:

Subject: RE: Steat General Fence - meeting

Attachments; 462-0288 Teangue Com Graz 1250m Fence.docx; 462-0289 Sleat Gen Com Graz
4174m Fence.docx

pear [

As requested | attach herewith a copy of the CAGS8a approval for Teangue Common Grazing
and Sleat General .

The principal copies have been sent to_,

Regards

Rural Buildings Officer

ARFC: Rural Payments & Inspections Division
Fstates Office

Portree

Isle of Skye

V51 9DH

gov.scot

Sent: 22 October 2018 10:20
To:
Subject: RE: Sleat General Fence - meeting

Thanks N

Can you send me a copy of it by email please?

gov.scot>

Thanks




From: [ - <ot
Sent: 22 October 2018 10:04

To: I

Subject: RE: Sleat General Fence - meeting

Morning -

Probably no need to have a meeting as this case file is the next one on my list and will be sent out
to them probably by Wednesday if not tomorrow.
Regards

Rural Buildings Officer

ARFC: Rural Payments & inspections Division
Estates Office

Portree

Isle of Skya

V51 9DH

ov.scot

e

Sent; ctober R

To: OV.5Cot>
Subject: Sleat General Fence - meeting

il
Could we have a meeting about this on Wednesday?
The committee are wanting an update for their meeting end of the week

Thanks

SRUC/SAC Consuiting | Unit 3 | 6 Leasgeary Road | Portree | V51 9BE Tei:_| Email

sac.co.uk | Web: www.sac.co.uk




From: googlemail.com>

Sent: 03 October 2018 11:20

To:

Subject: Fwd: Sleat General and Teangue CG CAGS fence applications

Attachments: image002.jpg; ATT00001.htm; image004.png; ATTO0002.htm; COPY INVOICE No_

0818-009. Date_ 10_08 2018.pdf; ATT00003.him

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: sac.co.ulc>

Date: 1 October 2018 at 17:49:07 BST

To: | - oo il com)" @googlemail.com>

Subject: FW: Sleat General and Teangue CG CAGS fence applications

Please see email below.
Let me know if you require anything further

Best wishes

From: scotfast.co.uk]

Sent: 01 October 2018 15:43
To:
Subject: RE: Sleat General and Teangue CG CAGS fence applications

We do not have an actual quote for the works yet; we usually base a fence of approx. 5km on £6000
- £7000

I have attached a recent invoice for a similar length fence. Usually, a bundie has 100m each.

We would have to meet PDG {Helicopter provider) on site and show them drop locations etc. and
wouldn’t do this without an order in place.

Do you have an estimated start date?

Regards




Invoice No:  0818-009 COPY INVOICE

Ihwvoice Date:  10/08/2018
SL Code: TSCOO10
Order No:

ScotFast Ltd

The Dairy

Home Farm Steadings
Perth

PH2 7JZ

Attention; Scott Robinson

HELICOPTERS

The Heliport
Dalcross

Tel: +44(0) 1687 462 740
Fax: £44{0)16567 462 374

[ Description £ VAT Rate|

To: Hire of AS355 Squirrel Helicopter for lifting of fencing materials 31 July 2018

Pilot: Captain P Smith

Aireraf. G-PDGF

Location costs of helicopter £,155.00 20

45 fifes @ £97.00 per lift 4,365.00 20

Ground support + vehicle 450.00 20
55.00 20

Helibags 10 @ £5.50 per bag delivered

# PAYMENT £6,000.00 RECEIVED VIA CREDIT CARD 03.08,]18#%
BALANCE OF £1,230.00 DUE ON RECEIPT OF INVOICE

Payment Terms: Where payment in full is not received within term, we reserve the
right to charge interest of 15% pa on any outstanding balance.

Bank Details:
Account name: PLM Dollar Group Limited

Account nlw

Sort code:

-

o

VAT No: 20637761 |

Your contact for this job is_
Telephone: INNGTGTGTNGG-: I

Email: I @rdzhelicopters.com

ww.pdghel icopters.com

6,025,00
£,205.00
7,230.00

PEL.M Dollar Group Ltd
The Heliport, Dalcross
Inverness, IV2 7X8

Registered in Scotland
No, 157522






