
[redacted] 

From: 

Sent: 

To: 

Cc: 

Subject: 

Keir Bloomer <[redacted]> 
21 June 2017 15:15 
[redacted] 
[redacted] 
Re: Newlands Junior College - SG offer of funding 

Dear [redacted]

Thank you for this information. I shall tell Allan to expect a letter from you and also bring Jim 
Alex up to date. 

This is good news about the £120,000. Thank you for your help. 

All the best 

Keir 

On 21/6/17 15:06, "[redacted]@gov.scot" <[redacted]@gov.scot> wrote: 

Dear Keir 

Thank you for your e mail & helpful update. 

I have today issued our formal grant offer letter to Alan Dowie - I've sent this by Royal Mail (first 
class) rather the email as there are documents to sign & return to confirm acceptance, so he 
should receive tis tomorrow. 

With regard to your question about an interim payment on the basis that you have already 
received around £120,000 LA funding, this should not present any difficulties and we can agree a 
payment profile following acceptance of our offer - the grant offer contains details about the 
process for submitting a claim for payment. I hope this addresses your question. 

Thanks again. 

Kind regards 

[redacted]

[redacted]
Empowering Schools Unit I People and Infrastructure I Learning Directorate I 2A South I Victoria 
Quay I EH6 6QQ 

[redacted]@gov.scot<mailto:[redacted]@gov.scot> I 0131 244 [redacted] I [redacted] 

From: Keir Bloomer [mailto:[redacted] 
Sent: 19 June 2017 17:31 
To: [redacted]
Cc: [redacted]
Subject: Re: Newlands Junior College - SG offer of funding 

Dear [redacted]

I hope you enjoyed your holiday. 
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Your email is well-timed. I had a meeting with Jim McColl this morning and was going to write to you 
to bring you up to date. 

Jim has had a very positive meeting with Susan Aitken, Leader of Glasgow City Council. She is very 
keen on partnership with NJC and says she is willing to match the funding from the government. She 
has to communicate this to the Director of Education and will meet her on this subject before the end 
of June. However, Jim is very confident that all will be well. 

Jim asked me to mention to you that Glasgow is already paying £100,000 per year into NJC and 
Renfrewshire is paying full matched funding in respect of its three NJC students. Therefore, we are 
already receiving a certain amount of local authority funding amounting to around £120,000 in 
total. Will the government be willing to release an amount equivalent to this as a first installment, 
pending our securing of the remainder of the Glasgow funding? 

As it happens, I was in St Andrews House this afternoon, meeting Paul Johnston. He asked me for an 
update on NJC. I gave him the same information as above and also posed the question about 
receiving a first installment. He may well raise these issues with you. 

All the best 

Keir 

On 19/6/17 17: 13, "[redacted]@gov .scot" <[redacted]@gov .scot> wrote: 
Dear Keir 

I'm now back in the office after my holiday - not sure if you're still on holiday, if so, I'm sure you'll be 
enjoying this excellent weather. 

However, in catching up with emails I don't seem to have received anything further following our 
exchange earlier in the month and just wanted to check I hadn't missed a communication from you. 

Many thanks & kind regards 

[redacted] 

[redacted]
Empowering Schools Unit I People and Infrastructure I Learning Directorate I 2A South I Victoria 
Quay I EH6 6QQ 
[redacted]@gov.scot<mailto:[redacted]@gov.scot> I 0131 244 [redacted] I [redacted]

From: Keir Bloomer [mailto:[redacted]] 
Sent: 06 June 2017 12:48 
To: [redacted]
Subject: Re: Newlands Junior College - SG offer of funding 

Dear [redacted]

I am currently on holiday but I look at my emails regularly. 

Jim McColl is meeting the Leader of Glasgow City Council today. I haven't heard anything yet about 
any outcome but I am sure that his PA will keep me informed. I'll respond to your first question as 
soon as I can thereafter. 
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So far as your second question is concerned, you are right. The appropriate contact is Allan Dowie 
who acts as Treasurer to NJC as well as being the chief finance officer for ClydeBlowers. 

I'll consult Jim about publicity.  As you will not be making an announcement, I doubt if we will want to 
do so.

I hope you have a good holiday. 

All the best 

Keir 

On 6 June 2017 at 07:25, <[redacted]@gov.scot> wrote: 

Dear Keir 

Just a quick update at this end on where we are with our formal grant offer on the back of your 1 June 
note last week and a couple of questions for you. 

First, we have a final version ready which I propose to issue later this week. However, as you informed 
me, you are meeting Glasgow Council today to discuss local authority match funding, which is one of 
our conditions of support, and at the moment we don't know how they will respond. Therefore I would 
be grateful if you could confirm whether you wish to receive the letter this week or, depending on the 
outcome of your discussions with Glasgow, whether you would wish/need a little more time & space? 

Second, can you confirm who we should address the grant offer letter to - our previous one was 
addressed to Allan Dowie, CFO at Clyde Blowers. Should this one go to Allan too? 

Third, I mentioned previously that it would be helpful if we could keep discussions confidential until we   
had it all sorted out.  However, once we issue a grant letter we would, if asked, have to confirm we had 
done so.  While we do not anticipate making a public announcement about this, there may be             
questions raised about NJC following DFM'S statement on the Governance Review Next Steps next       
week.                                 

And finally, I shall be on leave from Friday 9 June to Friday 16 June (back in the office 19 
June). However, in my absence my colleague, [redacted], who you met previously when you came to 
discuss the NJC proposal, will be able to assist. Her email address is [redacted]@gov.scot & 
phone number: 0131 244 [redacted]
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Many thanks 

Kind regards 

[redacted]

[redacted]

Empowering Schools Unit I People and Infrastructure I Learning Directorate I 2A South I Victoria 
Quay I EH6 6QQ 

[redacted]@gov.scot<mailto:[redacted]@gov.scot> I 0131 244 [redacted] I [redacted] 

********************************************************************** 

This e-mail (and any files or other attachments transmitted with it) is intended solely for the 
attention of the addressee(s). Unauthorised use, disclosure, storage, copying or distribution of 
any part of this e-mail is not permitted. If you are not the intended recipient please destroy 
the email, remove any copies from your system and inform the sender immediately by return. 

Communications with the Scottish Government may be monitored or recorded in order to secure the 

effective operation of the system and for other lawful purposes. The views or opinions contained 

within this e-mail may not necessarily reflect those of the Scottish Government. 

Tha am post-ct seo (agus faidhle neo ceanglan cOrnhla ris) dhan neach neo luchd-ainmichte a-rnhain. 
Chan eil e ceadaichte a chleachdadh ann an dOigh sam bith, a' toirt a-steach cOraichean, 
foillseachadh neo sgaoileadh, gun chead. Ma 's e is gun d'fhuair sibh seo le gun fhiosd', bu 
choir cur as dhan phost-d agus lethbhreac sarn bith air an t-siostam agaibh, leig fios chun neach 
a sgaoil am post-ct gun ctail. 

Dh'fhaodadh gum bi teachdaireachd sam bith bho Riaghaltas na h-Alba air a chlaradh neo air a 
sgrUdadh airson dearbhadh gu bheil an siostam ag obair gu h-6ifeachdach neo airson adhbhar 
laghail eile. Dh'fhaodadh nach eil beachdan anns a' phost-d seo co-ionann ri beachdan Riaghaltas 
na h-Alba. 

********************************************************************** 

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service. 
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com 

*********************************** ******************************** 

This email has been received from an external party and 

has been swept for the presence of computer viruses. 

******************************************************************** 
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Keir Bloomer 
[redacted]

t: [redacted]
e: [redacted]

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service. 
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com 

*********************************** ******************************** 

This email has been received from an external party and 

has been swept for the presence of computer viruses. 

******************************************************************** 
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Scottish Government 
Riu91le1ltc1s nu 11 .. f\Uin
gov.scot 

Learning Directorate 

People and Infrastructure Division 

T: 0131-244 [redacted]
E: [redacted]@gov.scot

Mr Allan Dowie 
Treasurer 
Newlands Junior College 
6 lnverlair Avenue 
GLASGOW 
G43 2HS 

�\June 2017 

Dear Mr Dewie 

OFFER OF GRANT FOR NEWLANDS JUNIOR COLLEGE 2017/18 

The Scottish Ministers in exercise of their powers under section 42 (1) of the Standards in 
Scotland's Schools etc. Act 2000, hereby offer to give to Newlands Junior College Limited 
("the Grantee'') a grant of up to £345,000 STERLING, payable over the financial year 2017-
2018, in connection with the operating costs of Newlands Junior College, which is more 
particularly described in Part 1 of Schedule 1 ("the Project"), and subject to the following 
terms and conditions: 

1. Definitions and Interpretation

1.1 In these Conditions, the words and expressions set out in Schedule 4 shall have the 
meanings ascribed to them in that Schedule. 

1.2 In these Conditions unless the context otherwise requires, words denoting the 
singular shall include the plural and vice versa and words denoting any gender shall include 
all genders. 

1.3 The headings in these Conditions are for convenience only and shall not be read as 
forming part of the Conditions or taken into account in their interpretation. 

1.4 Except as otherwise provided in these Conditions, any reference to a clause, 
paragraph, sub-paragraph or schedule shall be a reference to a clause, paragraph, 
subparagraph or schedule of these Conditions. The schedules are intended to be contractual 
in nature. They form part of the Agreement and should be construed accordingly. 

Victoria Quay, Edinburgh EH6 6QQ 
www.gov.scot 
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15. Governing Law

This contract is governed by the Law of Scotland and the parties hereby prorogate to the 
exclusive jurisdiction of the Scottish Courts 

If you wish to accept the offer of this Grant on the whole terms and conditions as set out in 
the letter and annexed Schedules, you should sign and date bpth copies of the Grant 
Acceptance below and return one copy of the offer of Grant and Schedules to me at Scottish 
Government, Learning Directorate, Area 2A South, Victoria Quay, Edinburgh, EH6 6QQ. 
You should retain the second copy of the offer of Grant and Schedules for your own records. 

Yours sincerely, 

[redacted] 
June 2017 

[on behalf of the Scottish Government] 

Victoria Quay, Edinburgh EH6 6QQ

www.gov.scot 
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RECORDED DELIVERY 

26th June 2017 

[redacted] 
Scottish Government 
Victoria Quay 
EDINBURGH 
EH66QQ 

Dear [redacted]

OFFER OF GRANT FOR NEWLANDS JUNIOR COLLEGE 2017 /18 

Please find enclosed duly signed coy of the agreement. 

Many thanks. 

Kind regards 

Yours faithfully 

[redacted]
Office Manager 

6 lnverlair Avenue 

Glasgow G43 21-IS 

[redacted]
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Learning Directorate 
People and Infrastructure Division 

T: 0131-244 [redacted]
E: [redacted]@gov.scot 

Mr Allan Dowie 
Treasurer 
Newlands Junior College 
6 lnverlair Avenue 
GLASGOW 
G432HS 

c},\ June 2017

Dear Mr Dowie 

OFFER OF GRANT FOR NEWLANDS JUNIOR COLLEGE 2017/18 

The Scottish Ministers In exercise of their powers under section 42 (1) of the Standards in 
Scotland's Schools etc. Act 2000, hereby offer to give to Newlands Junior College Limited 
("the Grantee") a grant of up to £345,000 STERLING, payable over the financial year 2017-
2018, in connection with the operating costs of Newlands Junior College, which is more 
particularly described in Part 1 of Schedule 1 ("the Project"), and subject to the following 
terms and conditions: 

1. Definitions and Interpretation

1.1 In these Conditions, the words and expressions set out in Schedule 4 shall have the 
meanings ascribed to them in that Schedule. 

1.2 In these Conditions unless the context otherwise requires, words denoting the 
singular shall include the plural and vice versa and words denoting any gender shall include 
all genders. 

1.3 The headings in these Conditions are for convenience only and shall not be read as 
forming part of the Conditions or taken into account in their interpretation. 

1 A Except as otherwise provided in these Conditions, any reference to a clause, 
paragraph, sub-paragraph or schedule shall be a reference to a clause, paragraph, 
subparagraph or schedule of these Conditions. The schedules are intended to be contractual 
in nature. They form part of the Agreement and should be construed accordingly. 

Victoria Quay, Edinburgh EH6 6QQ 
www.gov.scot 
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15. Governing Law

This contract is governed by the Law of Scotland and the parties hereby prorogate to the 
exclusive jurisdiction of the Scottish Courts 

If you wish to accept the offer of this Grant on the whole terms and conditions as set out in 
the letter and annexed Schedules, you should sign and date both copies of the Grant 
Acceptance below and return one copy of the offer of Grant and Schedules to me at Scottish 
Government, Learning Directorate, Area 2A South, Victoria Quay, Edinburgh, EH6 6QQ. 
You should retain the second copy of the offer of Grant and Schedules for your own records. 

Yours sincerely, 

[redacted]
June 2017 

[on behalf of the Scottish Government] 

Victoria Quay, Edinburgh EH6 6QQ 
www.gov.scot 

8 

[redacted]




